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1449 Richmond Terrace, Staten Island, NY, 10310 

Contact: #908-249-3944 / #718-715-2014 

Email: twinpowercorp@gmail.com 

Accurate Temperature Control: 
The CAREL digital temperature 
controller is easy to use and 
provides accurate temperature 
control within a predetermined 
range (33–40°F) to maintain ideal 
temperatures. Advanced Defrost 
System: Consistent cooling 
performance is ensured by the 
automatic defrost function, 
which avoids frost 
accumulation. With caster 
wheels and wheel brakes for 
stability, the salad bar 
refrigerator is made for effortless 
mobility. It is easier to use and 
more accessible because to its 
two rubber anti-collision blocks 
that increase heat dissipation, 
its five-inch wheels that make 
cleaning simple, and its two self-
closing doors that automatically 
close when they get below ninety 
degrees. 

Model #: TSSP60M 

Dimensions: 57 X 23.4 X 28.63 

Capacity: 18 cu ft. 

Temp Range: 33F – 40F 

Refrigerant: R290 

Voltage: 115V/1/60Hz 

HP: 1/5 

Plug Type: NEMA 5-15P 

 


